Statutory Document No 026/11

SOCIAL SECURITY ACT 2000

SOCIAL SECURITY LEGISLATION (CONTRIBUTIONS)
(APPLICATION) (AMENDMENT) ORDER 2011

Approved by Tynwald 15 February 2011
Coming into operation 6 April 2011

The Treasury makes this Order' under section 12 of the Social Security Act
2000°.

1 Title
This Order is the Social Security Legislation (Contributions)

(Application) (Amendment) Order 2011.

2 Commencement
If approved by Tynwald?, this Order comes into operation on 6 April
2011.

3  Interpretation

(1) In this order “applied legislation” means —

(a) the Social Security (Contributions) (Re-rating) Order 20095

(b} section 141 of the Social Security Administration Act 19928

1 Bee article 6(1)(g) of, and A of Schedule 7 to, the Transfer of Functions (New Departments} (No. 2}
Order 2010 (5.D. 155/10)

* Section T was amended by paragraph 1(1)(b} of B of Schedule 7 to the Transfer of Functions (New
Departments) Order 2010 {S.D, 155/10)

3 2000¢5

4 As required by section 2{1) of the Social Security Act 2000

5 5.1, 2009/593

51992 ¢.5

Price £1.90




(2) Unless the context otherwise requires -

(a)

(b)

any reference in any of the applied legislation to any provision
in an instrument of a legislative character which is not itself a
provision of the applied legislation shall be construed as if the
provision so referred to had been in force in the Island from the
date on which that instrument of a legislative character had
effect in Great Britain;

reference in any legislation applied by this Order to any
provision of any such legislation or of any other legislation
applied to the Island by an order under section 1 of the Social
Security Act 2000 or section 1 of the Pension Schemes Act 1995,
shall be construed as a reference to that legislation as it has effect

in the Island.

4  Application to the Island of the applied legislation

The applied legislation, incorporating the exceptions, adaptations and
modifications subject to which it applies to the Island, is set out in
Schedules 1 and 2 to this Order and shall apply to the Island as part of
the law of the Island.

5 Amendment of the Social Security Administration Act 1992
(Application) Order 2004

(1) Section 141 of the Social Security Administration Act 1992 (of
Parliament) applies to the Island in the form set out in paragraph (2).

(2) That section as it applies to the Island is as follows.

“1471 — Annual review of contributions

(1) In each tax year the Treasury may make an order under this

section for the amendment of Part I of the Social Security
Contributions and Benefits Act 19928, as applied to the Island by
the Social Security Contributions and Benefits Act 1992

(Application) Order 1994°,

(2) An order under subsection (1) shall not come into operation

unless it is approved by Tynwald.”.

71995 ¢ 11
81992 ¢c. 4

9 G, 505/94. Relevant amendments made to 8.D. 505/94 by 5.D. 281/09 and S.D. 802/09.




The text of section 141 of the Act as it applies in Great Britain is
shown in Schedule 2 with the modifications incorporated.

6  Revocation
The Social Security Legislation (Contributions) (Application) (No. 2)
Order 2009% is revoked to the extent that it prescribes amounts under
the Social Security (Contributions) (Re-rating) Order 2009 (S.I. 2009 No.
593). The Social Security Legislation (Contributions) (Application) (No.
3) Order 2010" is also revoked.

Made

2 Sy PO

Minister for the Treasury

0 8.D. 281/09
1 5.D. 475/10




SCHEDULE 1

This Schedule sets out the text of the Social Security (Contributions) (Re-
rating) Order 2009 (5.1 2009/593) with such exceptions, adaptations and
modifications made where necessary, which appear in bold italic type.

STATUTORY
INSTRUMENTS

2009 No. 593

SOCIAL SECURITY

The Social Security (Contributions) (Re-rating) Order 2009
Citation, commencement and interpretation

1. (1) This Order may be cited as the Social Security (Contributions) (Re-
rating) Order 2009 and shall come into force on 6% April 2011.

(2) In this Order “the Act” means the Social Security Contributions and
Benefits Act 1992 and “the Regulations” means the Social Security
(Contributions) Regulations 2001.

Rate of and small earnings exception from Class 2 contributions
2. In section 11 of the Act (Class 2 contributions) -
(a) in subsection 1 for “£2,30” substitute “£2.50"; and

(b) in subsection (4) (small earnings exception) for “£4,825" substitute
“£5,315".

Amount of Class 3 contributions

3. In section 13(1) of the Act (amount of Class 3 contributions) for “£8.10”
substitute “£12.60".




Lower and upper limits for Class 4 confributions

4. In each of sections 15(3), 18(1) and 18(1A) of the Act (Class 4
contributions recoverable under regulations) -

(a) for “£5,435” (lower limit) in each place where it appears,
substitute “£5,980"; and

(b) for “£36,140” (upper limit) in each place where it appears,
substitute “£39,000”.

Earnings limits and thresholds
5. In regulation 10 of the Regulations -
(a) for “2010” substitute "2011";
(b) in paragraph (a), for “£97" substitute £102";
(c) in paragraph (b), for "£730" substitute "£750";
(d) in paragraph (c), for “£110” substitute “£115"; and
(e) in paragraph (d), for "£110" substitute “£115”.
Prescribed equivalents
6. In requlation 11(3) of the Regulations —
(a) in paragraph (a), for “476” substitute “£498"; and
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£5,715” substitute “£5,980”.
Share fishermen

7. In regulation 125(c) of the Regulations, for “£3.05” substitute “£3,15”,




SCHEDULE 2

This Schedule sets out the text of section 141 of The Social Security
Administration Act 1992 (of Parliament) with such exceptions, adaptations
and modifications made where necessary, which appear in bold italic type

and struck through text,

141.— Annual review of contributions.

(1) In each tax year the {Treasury} shall may earryouta-reviewof the general

memmwﬁe%ﬁmeﬂ% make an
order under this section shewld-be-made for the amendment of Part [ of the
Social Security Contributions and Benefits Act 1992, as applied to the Island
by the Social Security Contributions and Benefits Act 1992 (Application)

Order 1994 {bheyi—sha}kpfepﬂ%e-aﬁd%wbe%feeaelﬂ%e&see@aﬂ&ameﬂt-a




(2) An order under subsection (1) shall not come into operation unless it is
approved by Tynwald.




EXPLANATORY NOTE
(This note is not part of the Order)

. Section 1 of the Social Security Act 2000 enables the Treasury, by order,
to apply to the Island, as part of the law of the Island and incorporating
such exceptions, adaptations and modifications as may be specified by

the order, any legislation to which that section applies.

. Inter alia, the Act applies to the Social Security Contributions and
Benefits Act 1992 (an Act of the United Kingdom Parliament as it has
effect in the Isle of Man) and to any statutory instrument made or
having effect as if made under that Act.

. This Order revokes legislation applied to the Island in Article 6 of the
Order and applies to the Island the legislation referred to in Article 4 of
the Order, the provisions of which are summarised in the following
paragraphs. The applied legislation will come into force on 6 April
2011,

. The Social Security Contributions and Benefits Act 1992, as it is applied
to the Island, is amended, by increasing the rate of Class 2
contributions to £2.50 per week and also by increasing the small
earnings exception limit to £5,315. The Order also increases the
amount of a Class 3 contribution to £12.60 per week, as well as raising
the annual lower profits limit applicable to Class 4 contributions to
£5,980 and the annual upper profits limit to £39,000.

. The Social Security Administration Act 1992 (Application) Order 1994
is also amended to introduce Section 141 into the Social Security
Administration Act 1992, as applied to the Island. This will allow the
Treasury to amend Part I of that Act by an order.

. The Social Security Contributions Regulations 2001, as they are applied
to the Island, are amended by increasing both the lower and upper
earnings limits for Class 1 contributions to £102 and £750 respectively.
The primaty threshold for primary Class 1 contributions and the
secondary threshold for secondary Class 1 contributions are also
increased to £115 and the monthly and annual equivalent of those
thresholds are prescribed such that where the earnings period is a
month the threshold is £498 and where the earnings period is a year




the threshold is £5,980. The rate of the Class 2 share fisherman’s
contribution is also increased to £3.15 per week.




