Statutory Document 2015/0302

STATEMENT OF

CHANGES

IN IMMIGRATION RULES

Laid before Tynwald on 20" October 2015 under section 3(2) of the
Immigration Act 1971 (an Act of Parliament as extended to the Isle of Man by the
Immigration (Isle of Man) Order 2008 (SI 2008 no. 680))



STATEMENT OF CHANGES IN IMMIGRATION RULES

The Council of Ministers has made the following changes to the Rules laid down by
it as to the practice to be followed in the administration of the Immigration Act 1971!
(of Parliament) as it has effect in the Isle of Man? for regulating entry into and the
stay of persons in the Isle of Man and contained in the Statement laid before
Tynwald on 17t May 2005°.

The changes in this Statement shall take effect on 7t September 2015. However, if an
applicant has made an application for entry clearance or leave before 7t September
2015 and the application has not been decided before that date, it will be decided in
accordance with the rules in force on 6% September 2015.

. In paragraph 2, after “Isle of Man” delete “and in compliance with the provisions of
the Human Rights Act 2001 (an Act of Tynwald).”.

. In paragraph 6 delete the definition of “A “UK recognised body” and substitute:

“A "UK recognised body" is an institution that has been granted degree awarding
powers by either a Royal Charter, an Act of Parliament or the Privy Council. For the
purposes of these Rules we will consider the Foundation Programme Office, Health
Education South London and the Health Education Yorkshire and Humber as
equivalent to UK recognised bodies.”.

. In paragraph 6 delete the definition of “visa nationals” and substitute:

“n

visa nationals" are the persons specified in Appendix 2 to Appendix V: Visitors
who need a visa for the Isle of Man for a visit or for any other purposes where
seeking entry for 6 months or less”.

. In paragraph 6 delete the definition of “"non-visa nationals" and substitute:

“n

non-visa nationals" are persons who are not specified in Appendix 2 to Appendix
V Immigration Rules for Visitors.”.

. In paragraph 6, delete “Under Part 6A of these Rules, an "A-rated Sponsor" is a
Sponsor” and substitute:

“Under Appendix A of these Rules, an "A-rated Sponsor" is a Sponsor”.

11971 ¢c. 77

2 See the Immigration (Isle of Man) Order 2008 (S.I. 2008 No 680)

* S.D. 62/05 amended by 5.D.692/05, S.D. 442/06, S.D. 547/06, S.D. 781/06, S.D. 871/06, S.D. 124/07, S.D.
303/07, S.D. 534/07, S.D. 02/08, S.D. 500/08, GC 32/09, GC 35/09, GC 14/10, GC 26/10, GC 02/11, SD
518/11, SD 40/12, SD 0288/12, SD 0625/12, SD 0657/12, SD250/13, SD 302/13, SD 345/13 ,SD 2014/0004,
SD 2014/0082, SD 2014/241, 2014/314 , 2014/324 and 2015/0265.



6.

10.
11.
12.

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

In paragraph 6, delete “A "visitor" is a person granted leave to enter or remain in the
Isle of Man under paragraphs 40-56Z, 75A-M or 82-87 of these Rules.” and
substitute:

“A "visitor" is a person granted leave to enter or remain in the Isle of Man under
paragraphs 40-56Z, 75A-M or 82-87 of these Rules before 7t September 2015 or
under Appendix V: Immigration Rules for Visitors on or after 7t September 2015

In paragraph 6, delete the definition of “A "Business Visitor".“.

"y

In paragraph 6, delete the definition of “An "Academic Visitor"”.

"y

In paragraph 6, delete the definition of “A "Sports Visitor"”.

"y

In paragraph 6, delete the definition of “An "Entertainer Visitor"”.

"

In paragraph 6, delete the definition of “A "Special Visitor"”.

In paragraph 6, delete the definition of "A visitor undertaking permitted paid
engagements”.

In paragraph 8 at the end of (ii) delete “and” and at the end of (iii) delete “.” and
substitute “; and (iv) a condition restricting his studies in the Isle of Man.”.

After paragraph 18 insert a new paragraph:

“[18A] Those who qualify for admission to the Isle of Man as returning residents in
accordance with paragraph 18 do not need a visa to enter the Isle of Man.”.

After paragraph 20A insert a new paragraph:

“[20B] Those who seek leave to enter the Isle of Man within the period of their
earlier leave and for the same purpose as that for which that leave was granted,
unless it

(i) was for a period of six months or less; or

(ii) was extended by statutory instrument or by section 3C of the Immigration Act
1971 (inserted by section 3 of the Immigration and Asylum Act 1999); do not need a
visa to enter the Isle of Man.”.

In paragraph 34A insert after sub-paragraph (vi)(b):
“and

(vii) the requirements of paragraph 34BB must be met.”.
After paragraph 34B insert:

“(1) Not Used

(2) Where an application for limited or indefinite leave to remain in the Isle of Man is
made, for which an application form is specified, the application must be
accompanied by an original, valid passport, travel document or (unless the applicant



18.

19.
20.

21.

22.

is a Points Based System Migrant) national identity card issued to the applicant and
to any dependant included in the application, unless sub-paragraph (3) applies.

(3) This sub-paragraph applies where:
(i) the application is made:

(a) for limited leave to enable access to public funds pending an application
under paragraph 289A of, or section DVILR of Appendix FM to, these Rules;
or

(b) by a stateless person or the family member of a stateless person under Part
14 of these Rules; or

(c) Not Used
(ii) Not Used

(iii) the Lieutenant Governor considers that there is a good reason beyond the
control of the applicant or (as the case may be) the dependant, given in or
with the application, why an original, valid passport, travel document or
(unless the applicant is a Points Based System Migrant) national identity card
cannot be provided, e.g. where it has been permanently lost and there is no
functioning national government to issue a replacement.

(4) Where sub-paragraph (3)(iii) applies, the Lieutenant Governor may require the
person to provide alternative satisfactory evidence of his or her identity and
nationality.

(5) Where sub-paragraph (3)(ii) or (iii) applies to the applicant or (as the case may be)
to a dependant included in the application, the requirement in sub-paragraph (1) or
(as the case may be) (2) continues to apply to any other person included in the
application.”.

In heading between paragraphs 34F and 34G delete “in connection with
immigration” and substitute “for leave to remain”.

In paragraph 34G subsection (i) after “post” insert “by Royal Mail”.

In paragraph 34G subsection (iii) after “sent by courier” insert “, or other postal
services provider”.

In paragraph 34] delete “as soon as the passport is returned in response to that
request” and substitute “on the date that request is received by the Isle of Man
Immigration Office”.

In paragraph A39 delete “ Any person from a country listed in Appendix T Part 1
making an application for entry clearance to come to the Isle of Man for more than
six months or as a fiancé(e) or proposed civil partner applying for leave to enter
under Section EC-P:Entry clearance as a partner under Appendix FM or leave to
enter under paragraphs 290-291 in Part 8 of these Rules,” and insert



23.

24.

25.

“Any person making an application for entry clearance to come to the Isle of Man for
more than six months or as a fiancé(e) or proposed civil partner applying for leave to
enter under Section EC-P:Entry clearance as a partner under Appendix FM, having
been present in a country listed in Appendix T for more than six months
immediately prior to their application,”.

After paragraph B39, insert

“C39. Where a person has lawfully been present in a country not mentioned in
Appendix T for more than six months and they are applying for entry clearance as in
A39 in a country in Appendix T but have not been in that country or any other
country mentioned in Appendix T for more than six months immediately before
making their application, they will not be required to produce a medical certificate
showing they are free from active pulmonary TB. This does not alter the
discretionary powers as in paragraph 39 below.”.

After paragraph 39C insert:
“Power to interview a person with limited leave to enter or remain

39D. For the purpose of assessing whether any of the grounds of curtailment under
paragraphs 245DE(c), 245EE(c), 276BD1, 276BN1, 276BS1, 323 (other than 323(vii)),
323A, 323B, or 323C, apply the Lieutenant Governor may request a person who
holds limited leave to enter or remain in the Isle of Man to:

(i) provide additional information and evidence to the Isle of Man Immigration
Office at the address specified in the request within 28 calendar days of the date the
request is sent; and/or

(ii) attend an interview.”.
Delete paragraphs 40 to 56Z and substitute with:
“Transitional provisions Part 2 and Appendix V: Immigration Rules for Visitors

1 Appendix V: Immigration Rules for Visitors will apply to all visitor applications
for entry clearance, leave to enter or remain decided on or after 7" September 2015.

2. Not Used

3 An application made under paragraphs 56A to 56C for a parent of a child at school
visitor before 7t September 2015 will be decided as if it were an application for a Tier
4 (child) student under paragraphs 276BT1 to 276BV1 of these Rules.

4 From 7 September 2015 the following provisions of these rules will not apply to
visitors, except where specifically provided for in Appendix V: Immigration Rules
for Visitors:

a. Paragraph 6;
b. Part 1;
c. Part 9;



d. Appendix 1;
e. Not Used.”.
26. Delete paragraphs 75A to 75M.

27. At the end of Paragraph 77 insert “Study subject to the condition set out in Part 15 of
these Rules.”.

28. At the end of paragraph 80 insert “Study subject to the condition set out in Part 15 of
these Rules where the applicant is 18 years of age or over at the time their leave is
granted, or will be aged 18 or over before their period of limited leave expires.”.

29. In paragraph 145:
(i) at the end of (ii) delete “and”,
(ii) at the end of (iii) delete “.”

(iii) after (iii) insert :“, and (iv) study subject to the condition set out in Part 15 of
these Rules.”.

30. In paragraph 148:
(i) at the end of (ii) delete “and”,
(ii) at the end of (iii) delete “.”

(iii) after (iii) insert “, and (iv) study subject to the condition set out in Part 15 of
these Rules.”.

31. After paragraph 159A(v) insert:

“(va) satisfies the Entry Clearance Officer or Immigration Officer that, throughout their
employment in the Isle of Man, the employer intends to pay them at least the
National Minimum Wage rate to which they are entitled by the law in force at the
relevant time; and”.

32. After paragraph 159D(iv) insert:

“(iva) satisfies the Lieutenant Governor that, throughout their employment in the Isle of
Man, the employer intends to pay them at least the National Minimum Wage rate to
which they are entitled by the law in force at the relevant time; and”.

33. After paragraph 159EA (iii) insert:

“(iii)(a) satisfies the Lieutenant Governor that throughout their employment in the Isle of
Man, the employer intends to pay them at least the National Minimum Wage rate to
which they are entitled by the law in force at the relevant time; and”.

34. In paragraph 187 after “5 years” insert ”, subject to a condition on study as set out in
Part 15 of these Rules,”.

35. In paragraph 190 after “5 years” insert ”, subject to a condition on study as set out in
Part 15 of these Rules,”.



36.

37.

38.

39.

In paragraph 195 after “person with limited leave to enter or remain under
paragraphs 128-193” insert “, subject to a condition on study as set out in Part 15 of
these Rules,”.

In paragraph 1968 (i) after “granted” insert “, subject to a condition on study as set
out in Part 15 of these Rules,”. In (ii) after “2 years” insert “, subject to a condition on
study as set out in Part 15 of these Rules.”.

In paragraph 198:

(i) in (a) after “the person with limited leave to enter or remain under
paragraphs 128-193” insert “, subject to a condition on study as set out in Part
15 of these Rules where the applicant is 18 years of age or over at the time
their leave is granted, or will be aged 18 before their period of limited leave
expires,”,

(ii) in (b) after “30 months” insert “, subject to a condition on study as set out
in Part 15 of these Rules where the applicant is 18 years of age or over at the
time their leave is granted, or will be aged 18 before their period of limited
leave expires,”.

Delete paragraph 245AAA(a)(i) and substitute:

“(i) the applicant has been absent from the Isle of Man for a period of 180 days or less in

40.

any of the five consecutive 12 month periods preceding the date of the application
for leave to remain, except that any absence from the Isle of Man for the purpose of
assisting with the Ebola crisis which began in West Africa in 2014 shall not count
towards the 180 days, if the applicant provides evidence that this was the purpose of
the absence(s) and that his Sponsor agreed to the absence(s);”.

Delete paragraph 245C and substitute:

“245C. Purpose

This route is now closed except for indefinite leave to remain applications.”.

41.
42.

43.
44.

Delete paragraphs 245CA and 245CB.

In paragraph 245D(c), delete “, refer to money remaining available to the applicant
until such time as it is spent for the purposes of his business or businesses:” and
substitute “refer to investing funds in a business or businesses, or to money
remaining available to the applicant until such time as it is spent for the purposes of
his business or businesses:”.

In paragraph 245D(c)(ii), delete “‘Spent’” and substitute “‘Invested’ or ‘spent’”.
Delete paragraph 245D(c)(ii)(2) and substitute:

“(2) buying the business from a previous owner, where the money ultimately goes to

that previous owner (irrespective of whether it is received or held directly or
indirectly by that previous owner) rather than into the business being purchased



(This applies regardless of whether the money is channelled through the business en
route to the previous owner, for example by means of the applicant or business
purchasing ‘goodwill’ or other assets which were previously part of the business.),”.

45. In paragraph 245DB(f), delete:

“Except where the applicant has had entry clearance, leave to enter or leave to remain as
a Tier 1 (Entrepreneur) Migrant, a Businessperson or an Innovator in the 12 months

immediately before the date of application and is being assessed under Table 5 of
Appendix A,”

46.

and substitute:
“Where the applicant is being assessed under Table 4 of Appendix A,”.
Delete paragraph 245DB(g) to (j) and substitute:

“(g) The applicant must provide a business plan, setting out his proposed
business activities in the Isle of Man and how he expects to make his business
succeed.

(h) In making the assessment in (f), the Entry Clearance Officer will assess the
balance of probabilities. The Entry Clearance Officer may take into account
the following factors:

(i) the evidence the applicant has submitted;

(ii) the viability and credibility of the source of the money referred to in Table
4 of Appendix A;

(iii) the viability and credibility of the applicant's business plan and market
research into their chosen business sector;

(iv) the applicant's previous educational and business experience (or lack
thereof);

(v) the applicant's immigration history and previous activity in the Isle of
Man; and

(vi) any other relevant information.

(i) Where the applicant has had entry clearance, leave to enter or leave to
remain as a Tier 1 (Entrepreneur) Migrant, a Businessperson or an Innovator
in the 12 months immediately before the date of application, and is being
assessed under Table 5 of Appendix A, the Entry Clearance Officer must be
satisfied that:

(i) the applicant has established, taken over or become a director of one or
more genuine businesses in the Isle of Man, and has genuinely operated that
business or businesses while he had leave as a Tier 1 (Entrepreneur) Migrant,
a Businessperson or an Innovator; and



(ii) the applicant has genuinely invested the money referred to in Table 5 of
Appendix A into one or more genuine businesses in the Isle of Man to be
spent for the purpose of that business or businesses; and

(iii) the applicant genuinely intends to continue operating one or more
businesses in the Isle of Man; and

(iv) the applicant does not intend to take employment in the Isle of Man other
than under the terms of paragraph 245DE.

(j) In making the assessment in (i), the Entry Clearance Officer will assess the
balance of probabilities. The Entry Clearance Officer may take into account
the following factors:

(i) the evidence the applicant has submitted;

(i) the viability and credibility of the source of the money referred to in Table
5 of Appendix A;

(iii) the credibility of the financial accounts of the business or businesses;

(iv) the credibility of the applicant's business activity in the Isle of Man,
including when he had leave as a Tier 1 (Entrepreneur) Migrant, a
Businessperson or an Innovator;

(v) the credibility of the job creation for which the applicant is claiming points
in Table 5 of Appendix A;

(vii) if the nature of the business requires mandatory accreditation,
registration and/or insurance, whether that accreditation, registration and/or
insurance has been obtained; and

(viii) any other relevant information.

(k) The Entry Clearance Officer reserves the right to request additional
information and evidence to support the assessment in (f) or (i), and to refuse
the application if the information or evidence is not provided. Any requested
documents must be received by the Entry Clearance Officer at the address
specified in the request within 28 calendar days of the date of the request.

(1) If the Entry Clearance Officer is not satisfied with the genuineness of the
application in relation to a points-scoring requirement in Appendix A, those
points will not be awarded.

(m) The Entry Clearance Officer may decide not to carry out the assessment in
(f) or (i) if the application already falls for refusal on other grounds, but
reserves the right to carry out this assessment in any reconsideration of the
decision.



47.

48.

49.

50.

51.

52.

(n) The applicant must, unless he provides a reasonable explanation, comply
with any request made by the Entry Clearance Officer to attend for
interview.”.

After new paragraph 245DB(n) above, renumber existing sub-paragraphs (k)
to (m) as (0) to (q) respectively.

In paragraph 245DC:
(i) at the end of (iii) delete “and”,
(ii)At the end of (iv) delete “.”

(iii) after (iv) insert “, and (v) study subject to the condition set out in Part 15
of these Rules where the applicant is 18 years of age or over at the time their
leave is granted, or will be aged 18 before their period of limited leave
expires.”.

In Part 6A, paragraph 245DD(e)(xxi) delete “as a Tier 4 Migrant” and insert:

“as a Tier 4 (General) Student and, in respect of such leave, is or was last
sponsored by:

(1) a UK recognised body or a body in receipt of public funding as a higher
education institution from the Department of Employment and Learning
in Northern Ireland, the Higher Education Funding Council for England,
the Higher Education Funding Council for Wales or the Scottish Funding
Council; or

(2) an overseas higher education institution to undertake a short-term study
abroad programme in the United Kingdom; or

(3) an Embedded College offering Pathway Courses,”.
In Part 6A after paragraph 245DD(e)(xxi), insert:
245DD(e)(xxii) “as a Tier 4 (Child) Student, or”.

In paragraph 245DD(h), delete:

“Except where the applicant has, or was last granted, leave as a Tier 1
(Entrepreneur) Migrant, a Businessperson or an Innovator and is being
assessed under Table 5 of Appendix A,”

and substitute:
“Where the applicant is being assessed under Table 4 of Appendix A,”.
Delete paragraph 245DD(i) to (1) and substitute:

“(i) The applicant must provide a business plan, setting out his proposed
business activities in the Isle of Man and how he expects to make his business
succeed.



(j) In making the assessment in (h), the Lieutenant Governor will assess the
balance of probabilities. The Lieutenant Governor may take into account the
following factors:

(i) the evidence the applicant has submitted;

(i) the viability and credibility of the source of the money referred to in Table
4 of Appendix A;

(iii) the viability and credibility of the applicant's business plans and market
research into their chosen business sector;

(iv) the applicant's previous educational and business experience (or lack
thereof);

(v) the applicant's immigration history and previous activity in the Isle of
Man;

(vi) where the applicant has already registered in the Isle of Man as self-
employed or as the director of a business, and the nature of the business
requires mandatory accreditation, registration and/or insurance, whether that
accreditation, registration and/or insurance has been obtained; and

(vii) any other relevant information.

(k) Where the applicant has, or was last granted, leave as a Tier 1
(Entrepreneur) Migrant, a Businessperson or an Innovator, and is being
assessed under Table 5 of Appendix A, the Lieutenant Governor must be
satisfied that:

(i) the applicant has established, taken over or become a director of one or
more genuine businesses in the Isle of Man, and has genuinely operated that
business or businesses while he had leave as a Tier 1 (Entrepreneur) Migrant,
a Businessperson or an Innovator; and

(ii) the applicant has genuinely invested the money referred to in Table 5 of
Appendix A into one or more genuine businesses in the Isle of Man to be
spent for the purpose of that business or businesses; and

(iii) the applicant genuinely intends to continue operating one or more
businesses in the Isle of Man; and

(iv) the applicant does not intend to take employment in the Isle of Man other
than under the terms of paragraph 245DE.

(I) In making the assessment in (k), the Lieutenant Governor will assess the
balance of probabilities. The Lieutenant Governor may take into account the
following factors:

(i) the evidence the applicant has submitted;



53.

54.

55.

(ii) the viability and credibility of the source of the money referred to in Table
5 of Appendix A;

(iii) the credibility of the financial accounts of the business or businesses;

(iv) the credibility of the applicant's business activity in the Isle of Man,
including when he had leave as a Tier 1 (Entrepreneur) Migrant, a
Businessperson or an Innovator;

(v) the credibility of the job creation for which the applicant is claiming points
in Table 5 of Appendix A;

(vii) if the nature of the business requires mandatory accreditation,
registration and/or insurance, whether that accreditation, registration and/or
insurance has been obtained; and

(viii) any other relevant information.

(m) The Lieutenant Governor reserves the right to request additional
information and evidence to support the assessment in (h) or (k), and to
refuse the application if the information or evidence is not provided. Any
requested documents must be received by the Lieutenant Governor at the
address specified in the request within 28 calendar days of the date of the
request.

(n) If the Lieutenant Governor is not satisfied with the genuineness of the
application in relation to a points-scoring requirement in Appendix A, those
points will not be awarded.

(0) The Lieutenant Governor may decide not to carry out the assessment in (h)
or (k) if the application already falls for refusal on other grounds, but reserves
the right to carry out this assessment in any reconsideration of the decision.”.

After new paragraph 245DD(0) above, renumber existing sub-paragraphs (m)
to (p) as (p) to (s) respectively.

After paragraph 245DE(b) (iv) delete “.” and insert “, and (v) study subject to
the condition set out in Part 15 of these Rules where the applicant is 18 years
of age or over at the time their leave is granted, or will be aged 18 before their
period of limited leave expires.”.

After paragraph 245DF(e), insert:
“(f) The Lieutenant Governor must be satisfied that:

(i) the applicant has established, taken over or become a director of one or
more genuine businesses in the Isle of Man, and has genuinely operated that
business or businesses while he had leave as a Tier 1 (Entrepreneur) Migrant,
a Businessperson or an Innovator; and



56.

(ii) the applicant has genuinely invested the money referred to in Table 6 of
Appendix A into one or more businesses in the Isle of Man to be spent for the
purpose of that business or businesses; and

(iii) the applicant genuinely intends to continue operating one or more
businesses in the Isle of Man.

(g) In making the assessment in (f), the Lieutenant Governor will assess the
balance of probabilities. The Lieutenant Governor may take into account the
following factors:

(i) the evidence the applicant has submitted;

(i) the viability and credibility of the source of the money referred to in Table
6 of Appendix A;

(iii) the credibility of the financial accounts of the business or businesses;

(iv) the credibility of the applicant's business activity in the Isle of Man,
including when he had leave as a Tier 1 (Entrepreneur) Migrant, a
Businessperson or an Innovator;

(v) the credibility of the job creation for which the applicant is claiming points
in Table 6 of Appendix A;

(vii) if the nature of the business requires mandatory accreditation,
registration and/or insurance, whether that accreditation, registration and/or
insurance has been obtained; and

(viii) any other relevant information.

(h) The Lieutenant Governor reserves the right to request additional
information and evidence to support the assessment in (f), and to refuse the
application if the information or evidence is not provided. Any requested
documents must be received by the Lieutenant Governor at the address
specified in the request within 28 calendar days of the date of the request.

(i) If the Lieutenant Governor is not satisfied with the genuineness of the
application in relation to a points-scoring requirement in Appendix A, those
points will not be awarded.

(j) The Lieutenant Governor may decide not to carry out the assessment in (f)
if the application already falls for refusal on other grounds, but reserves the
right to carry out this assessment in any reconsideration of the decision.

(k) The applicant must, unless he provides a reasonable explanation, comply
with any request made by the Lieutenant Governor to attend for interview.”.

Delete paragraph 245EB(d) to (f) and substitute:

“(d) The applicant must be at least 18 years old and the assets and investment
he is claiming points for must be wholly under his control.”.



57. In paragraph 245EB, renumber sub-paragraph (g) as (e).

58.

59.

60.

61.

62.

63.

64.

After paragraph 245EC (iv) delete “.” and insert “, and (v) study subject to the
condition set out in Part 15 of these Rules.”.

In paragraph 245ED(c) delete “(xvi) as a Tier 4 Migrant” and insert:

“(xvi) as a Tier 4 (General) Student and, in respect of such leave, is or was last
sponsored by:

(1) a UK recognised body or a body in receipt of public funding as a higher
education institution from the Department of Employment and Learning in
Northern Ireland, the Higher Education Funding Council for England, the
Higher Education Funding Council for Wales or the Scottish Funding
Council; or

(2) an overseas higher education institution to undertake a short-term study
abroad programme in the United Kingdom; or

(3) an Embedded College offering Pathway Courses, or
(xvii) as a Tier 4 (Child) Student.”.
Delete paragraph 245ED(e) to (g) and substitute:

“(e) The applicant must be at least 18 years old and the assets and investment
he is claiming points for must be wholly under his control.”.

In paragraph 245ED, renumber sub-paragraphs (h) and (i) as (f) and (g)
respectively.

After paragraph 245EE (b) (iv) delete “.” and insert “, and (v) study subject to
the condition set out in Part 15 of these Rules.”.

In paragraph 245FB(e)(i) after “as a Tier 4 Migrant” insert:
“and, in respect of such leave, is or was last sponsored by:

(1) a UK recognised body or a body in receipt of public funding as a higher
education institution from the Department of Employment and Learning in
Northern Ireland, the Higher Education Funding Council for England, the
Higher Education Funding Council for Wales or the Scottish Funding
Council; or

(2) an overseas higher education institution to undertake a short-term study
abroad programme in the United Kingdom”.

In paragraph 245FC (iii) delete “and”. In (iv) delete “.” and substitute “, and
(v) study subject to the condition set out in Part 15 of these Rules where the
applicant is 18 years of age or over at the time their leave is granted, or will be
aged 18 before their period of limited leave expires.”.



65. At the start of paragraph 245GB(d), delete “The applicant” and substitute
“Except where the period of engagement recorded by the Certificate of
Sponsorship used in support of such entry clearance or leave to remain was
granted for a period of three months or less, the applicant”.

66. In paragraph 245GB(e)(iii), delete “£153,500” and substitute “£155,300 per
year”.

67. In paragraph 245GC (d) (ii) delete “and”.

68. In paragraph 245GC (d) (iii) (2) delete “.” and substitute “, and (iv) study
subject to the condition set out in Part 15 of these Rules where the applicant is
18 years of age or over at the time their leave is granted, or will be aged 18
before their period of limited leave expires.”.

69. In paragraph 245GE(b)(iii)(2), delete “£153,500, (or £152,100 if the Certificate
of Sponsorship used in support of the application was assigned to him before
6 April 2014)” and substitute “£155,300 (or £153,500 if the Certificate of
Sponsorship used in support of the application was assigned to him before 6
April 2015)”.

70. In paragraph 245GE(b)(iv)(2), delete “£153,500, (or £152,100 if the Certificate
of Sponsorship used in support of the application was assigned to him before
6 April 2014)” and substitute “£155,300 (or £153,500 if the Certificate of
Sponsorship used in support of the application was assigned to him before 6
April 2015)”.

71. At the start of paragraph 245HB(g), delete “The applicant” and substitute
“Except where the period of engagement recorded by the Certificate of
Sponsorship used in support of such entry clearance or leave to remain was
three months or less, the applicant”.

72. In paragraph 245HB(g)(ii), delete “£153,500” and substitute “£155,300 per
year”.

73. In paragraph 245HB(I), delete “£153,500” and substitute “£155,300 per year”.

74. After paragraph 245HC (d) (iii) (4) delete “.” and substitute “, and (iv) study
subject to the condition set out in Part 15 of these Rules where the applicant is
18 years of age or over at the time their leave is granted, or will be aged 18
before their period of limited leave expires.”.

75. In Part 6A, after 245HD(b)(ii)(1) after “a Tier 4 Migrant” insert:
“and, in respect of such leave, is or was last sponsored by:

(1) a UK recognised body or a body in receipt of public funding as a higher
education institution from the Department of Employment and Learning in
Northern Ireland, the Higher Education Funding Council for England, the



76.

77.

78.

79.
80.
81.

82.

83.

84.

Higher Education Funding Council for Wales or the Scottish Funding
Council; or

(2) an overseas higher education institution to undertake a short-term study
abroad programme in the United Kingdom”.

In Part 6A, paragraph 245HD(d)(ii), after “The applicant” insert “(other than
an applicant under b(ii)(1) above)”.

At the start of paragraph 245HD(k), delete “The applicant” and substitute
“Except where the period of engagement recorded by the Certificate of
Sponsorship used in support of such entry clearance or leave to remain was
three months or less, the applicant”.

In paragraph 245HD(k)(iii), delete “£153,500” and substitute “£155,300 per
year”.

In paragraph 245HD(0), delete “£153,500” and substitute “£155,300 per year”.
In paragraph 245HE (d) (ii) delete “and”.

In (d) (iii) (4) delete “.” and substitute “, and (iv) study subject to the
condition set out in Part 15 of these Rules where the applicant is 18 years of
age or over at the time their leave is granted, or will be aged 18 before their
period of limited leave expires.”.

Delete paragraph 245HF(c)(vi) and substitute:

“(vi) as a Tier 1 Migrant, other than a Tier 1 (Post Study Work) Migrant or a
Tier 1 (Graduate Entrepreneur) Migrant,”.

After paragraph 245ZL (e) (iii) insert “(f) study subject to the condition set out
in Part 15 of these Rules.”.

After paragraph 245Z0(e) insert:
“(f) to (h) Not used
(i) The Entry Clearance Officer or Immigration Officer must be satisfied that:

(i) the applicant genuinely intends to undertake, and is capable of
undertaking, the role recorded by the Certificate of Sponsorship
Checking Service; and

(i) the applicant will not undertake employment in the United
Kingdom other than under the terms of paragraph 245ZP(f)(iii); and (j)
To support the assessment in paragraph 24570

(j), the Entry Clearance Officer or Immigration Officer may:

(i) request additional information and evidence, and refuse the
application if the information or evidence is not provided. Any
requested documents must be received by the Home Office at the



85.
86.

87.

88.

89.
90.

address specified in the request within 28 calendar days of the date the
request is sent, and

(ii) request the applicant attends an interview, and refuse the
application if the applicant fails to comply with any such request
without providing a reasonable explanation.

(k) If the Entry Clearance Officer or Immigration Officer is not satisfied
following the assessment in paragraph 245Z0(i), no points will be awarded
under paragraphs 105 to 112 of Appendix A.

(I) The Entry Clearance Officer or Immigration Officer may decide not to carry
out the assessment in paragraph 245Z0(i) if the application already falls for
refusal on other grounds, but reserves the right to carry out this assessment in
any reconsideration of the decision.”.

In paragraph 245ZP(f) (ii) delete “and”.

At the end of 245ZP(f) (iii) insert “(iv) study subject to the condition set out in
Part 15 of these Rules where the applicant is 18 years of age or over at the time
their leave is granted, or will be aged 18 before their period of limited leave
expires.”.

Delete paragraph 2457Q(b)(ii) and substitute with:

“(ii) entry clearance, leave to enter or leave to remain as a visitor who has
been in the Isle of Man undertaking permitted activities in the sports or
creative sectors, provided:

(1) the Certificate of Sponsorship Checking Service reference for which he is
being awarded points in this application shows that he is being sponsored in
the creative and sporting subcategory; and

(2) the Certificate of Sponsorship reference number was allocated to the
applicant before he entered the Isle of Man as a visitor (excluding visitors for
permitted paid engagements, marriage or civil partnership or transit), or”.

Delete paragraph 245ZQ(b)(iii) and substitute:

“(iii) Not used

(iv) Not used

(v) Not used”.

Re-number the existing paragraph 245ZQ(iii) as (vi).

In the new paragraph 245ZQ(vi) after “a Tier 4 (General) Migrant” insert:
“who, in respect of such leave, is or was last sponsored by:

(1) a UK recognised body or a body in receipt of public funding as a higher
education institution from the Department of Employment and Learning in



91.

92.

93.

Northern Ireland, the Higher Education Funding Council for England, the
Higher Education Funding Council for Wales or the Scottish Funding
Council; or

(2) an overseas higher education institution to undertake a short-term study
abroad programme in the United Kingdom”.

After paragraph 245ZQ)(i) insert:
“(j) Not used
(k) The Lieutenant Governor must be satisfied that:

(i) the applicant genuinely intends to undertake, and is capable of
undertaking, the role recorded by the Certificate of Sponsorship
Checking Service; and

(i) the applicant will not undertake employment in the Isle of Man
other than under the terms of paragraph 245ZR(h)(iii); and

(iii) Not used

(I) To support the assessment in paragraph 245ZQ(k), the Lieutenant
Governor may:

(i) request additional information and evidence, and refuse the
application if the information or evidence is not provided. Any
requested documents must be received by the Isle of Man Immigration
Office at the address specified in the request within 28 calendar days of
the date the request is sent, and

(ii) request the applicant attends an interview, and refuse the
application if the applicant fails to comply with any such request
without providing a reasonable explanation.

(m) If the Lieutenant Governor is not satisfied following the assessment in
paragraph 245ZQ(k), no points will be awarded under paragraphs 105 to 112
of Appendix A.

(n) The Lieutenant Governor may decide not to carry out the assessment in
paragraph 2457Q(k) if the application already falls for refusal on other
grounds, but reserves the right to carry out this assessment in any
reconsideration of the decision.”.

After paragraph 245ZR (h) (iii) insert:
“(iv) Not used

(v) study subject to the condition set out in Part 15 of these Rules where the
applicant is 18 years of age or over at the time their leave is granted, or will be
aged 18 before their period of limited leave expires.”.

In paragraph 2457V (g) delete “3” and substitute “2”.



94. In paragraph 2457V (ga)(i), delete “sponsored by a Sponsor that is a
Recognised Body” substitute “sponsored by a UK Recognised Body”.

95. In paragraph 2457V (ga)(ii), delete “sponsored by a Sponsor that is a
Recognised Body” substitute “sponsored by a UK Recognised Body”.

96. In paragraph 245ZW(b), in the first row of the table, after “1 month” insert
“before the course starts or 7 days before the intended date of travel,
whichever is later”.

97. In paragraph 245ZW(b), in the second row of the table, after “1 month” insert
“before the course starts or 7 days before the intended date of travel,
whichever is later”.

98. In paragraph 245ZW(b), in the third row of the table, after “1 month” insert
“before the course starts or 7 days before the intended date of travel,
whichever is later”.

99. In paragraph 245ZW(b), in the fourth row of the table, after “7 days” insert
“before the course starts”.

100.In paragraph 245ZW(b), in the fifth row of the table, after “1 month” insert
“before the course starts or 7 days before the intended date of travel,
whichever is later”.

101.In paragraph 245ZW(b)(i), delete “If the grant of entry clearance is made less
than 1 month or, in the case of a course of less than 6 months that is not a pre-
sessional course, less than 7 days before the start of the course, entry clearance
will be granted with immediate effect.” and substitute “If the grant of entry
clearance is made less than 7 days before the intended date of travel, entry
clearance will be granted with immediate effect.”.

102.In after paragraph 245ZW(b)(i), insert:

“(aii) The intended date of travel is the date recorded by the applicant either
through the relevant online application process or in the specified application
form for Tier 4 (General) Students, as their intended date for travel to the Isle
of Man.”.

103.In paragraph 245ZW (b)(iii) replace “disregarded” with “included”.
104.In delete paragraph 245ZW(c)(iii)(3).

105.In paragraph 245ZW/(c)(iii)(6) delete “postgraduate doctor or dentist” and
insert “Postgraduate Doctor or Dentist”.

106.In paragraph 245ZW(c)(iii)(1)(a), delete “sponsored by a Sponsor that is a
Recognised Body” substitute “sponsored by a UK Recognised Body”.

107.In paragraph 245ZW(c)(iii)(2), delete “sponsored by a Sponsor that is a
Recognised Body” substitute “sponsored by a UK Recognised Body”.



108. In paragraph 245ZW/(c)(iii)(4)(ii)(a), delete “sponsored by a Sponsor that is a
Recognised Body” substitute “sponsored by a UK Recognised Body”.

109. In paragraph 245ZW(c)(iii)(7), delete “Sponsor that is a Recognised Body”
substitute “UK Recognised Body”.

110. In paragraph 245ZW(c)(iii)(8)(b), delete “Sponsor that is a Recognised Body”
substitute “UK Recognised Body”.

111. In paragraph 245ZX, delete (b)(viii).
112. Delete paragraph 245ZX(b)(i) and insert:

(i) as a Tier 4 (General) Student, and, in respect of such leave, is or was last
sponsored by:

(1) a UK recognised body or a body in receipt of public funding as a higher
education institution from the Department of Employment and Learning in
Northern Ireland, the Higher Education Funding Council for England, the
Higher Education Funding Council for Wales or the Scottish Funding
Council; or

(2) an overseas higher education institution to undertake a short-term study
abroad programme in the United Kingdom; or

(3) an Embedded College offering Pathway Courses.”.
113. In Part 6A, paragraph 245ZX(h) delete “3” and substitute “2”.

114. In paragraph 245ZX(ha)(i), delete “sponsored by a Sponsor that is a
Recognised Body” substitute “sponsored by a UK Recognised Body”.

115. In paragraph 245ZX(ha)(ii), delete “sponsored by a Sponsor that is a
Recognised Body” substitute “sponsored by a UK Recognised Body”.

116. In paragraph 245ZY (b)(iii), delete “disregarded” and substitute “included”.

117. In paragraph 2457Y(c)(iii)(1)(a), delete “sponsored by a Sponsor that is a
Recognised Body” substitute “sponsored by a UK Recognised Body”.

118. In paragraph 2457Y(c)(iii)(2), delete “sponsored by a Sponsor that is a
Recognised Body” substitute “sponsored by a UK Recognised Body”.

119. Delete paragraph 2457 (c)(iii)(3).

120. In paragraph 2457Y/(c)(iii)(6) delete “postgraduate doctor or dentist” and
insert “Postgraduate Doctor or Dentist”.

121. In paragraph 2457Y(c)(iii)(7), delete “Sponsor that is a Recognised Body”
substitute “UK Recognised Body”.

122. In paragraph 2457Y/(c)(iii)(8), delete “Sponsor that is a Recognised Body”
substitute “UK Recognised Body”.

123. In paragraph 24577, after “Isle of Man” insert “at an Independent School.”.



124.
125.

126.

127.

128.

129.
130.
131.

132.

133.

134.

135.

In paragraph 245ZZA(i), after “met” insert “.”.

In paragraph 24577B(a)(i), after “1 month before the course starts” insert “or
7 days before the intended date of travel, whichever is later”.

In paragraph 245727B(a), after (iii) insert “The intended date of travel is the
date recorded by the applicant, either through the relevant online application
process or in the specified application form for Tier 4 (Child) Students, as
their intended date for travel to the Isle of Man.”.

In paragraph 245ZZB(b)(i), after “1 month before the course starts” insert “or
7 days before the intended date of travel, whichever is later”.

In paragraph 245ZZB(b), after (iii) insert “The intended date of travel is the
date recorded by the applicant, either through the relevant online application
process or in the specified application form for Tier 4 (Child) Students, as
their intended date for travel to the Isle of Man.”.

In Part 6A at the end of paragraph 24527B(c)(iv)(3), insert “,”.
In paragraph 245ZZC, delete (b)(iii).

In paragraph 267 after “employment” insert “and a condition on study as set
out in Part 15 of these Rules.”.

In paragraph 272 after “granted to the person with limited leave to enter or
remain as a retired person of independent means” insert “subject to a
condition on study as set out in Part 15 of these Rules.”.

In paragraph 273B in (i) after “person with limited leave to enter or remain”
insert “, subject to a condition on study as set out in Part 15 of these Rules”. In
(i) after “2 years” insert “, subject to a condition on study as set out in Part 15
of these Rules,”.

In paragraph 275 in (a) after “person with limited leave to enter or remain as a
retired person of independent means” insert “, subject to a condition on study
as set out in Part 15 of these Rules,”. In (b) after “30 months” insert “, subject
to a condition on study as set out in Part 15 of these Rules,”.

After paragraph 276A00 insert:

“276A01(1). Where an applicant for leave to enter the Isle of Man remains in
the Isle of Man on temporary admission or temporary release and satisfies
the requirements in paragraph 276 ADE(1), as if those were requirements for
leave to enter not leave to remain (and except that the reference to “leave to
remain” in sub-paragraph (ii) is to be read as if it said “leave to enter”), or the
Lieutenant Governor decides to grant leave to enter outside the rules on
Article 8 grounds:

(a) paragraph 276BE(1) shall apply, as if the first reference in paragraph
276BE(1) to limited leave to remain were to limited leave to enter and as if the



136.

wording from “provided that” to “under this sub-paragraph” were omitted;
and

(b) paragraph 276BE(2) shall apply, as if the reference in paragraph 276BE(2)
to limited leave to remain were to limited leave to enter.

(2). Where leave to enter is granted in accordance with paragraph 276A01(1),
paragraph 276BE(1) shall apply to an application for leave to remain on the
grounds of private life in the Isle of Man as if for “leave to remain under this
sub-paragraph” there were substituted “leave to enter in accordance with
paragraph 276A01(1).

276A02. In all cases where:

(a) limited leave on the grounds of private life in the Isle of Man is granted
under paragraph 276BE(1) or 276DG; or

(b) limited leave is granted outside the rules on Article 8 grounds under
paragraph 276BE(2),

leave will normally be granted subject to a condition of no recourse to public
funds, unless the applicant has provided the decision-maker with (i)
satisfactory evidence that the applicant is destitute as defined in section 95 of
the Immigration and Asylum Act 1999, or (ii) satisfactory evidence that there
are particularly compelling reasons relating to the welfare of a child of a
parent in receipt of a very low income.

276A03. Where a person aged 18 or over is granted limited leave to remain
under this Part on the basis of long residence or private life in the Isle of Man
or limited leave to enter in accordance with paragraph 276A01(1) (or limited
leave to enter or remain outside the rules on Article 8 grounds), or where a
person granted such limited leave to enter or remain will be aged 18 before
that period of limited leave expires, the leave will, in addition to any other
conditions which may apply, be granted subject to the conditions in Part 15 of
these rules.”.

After paragraph 276 A03 insert:

“276A04. Where a person who has made an application for indefinite leave to
remain under this Part does not meet the requirements for indefinite leave to
remain but falls to be granted limited leave to remain under this Part on the
basis of long residence or private life in the Isle of Man, or outside the rules on
Article 8 grounds:

(a) The Lieutenant Governor will treat that application for indefinite leave to
remain as an application for limited leave to remain;

(b) Not used
(c) Not used”.



137.
138.

139.
140.

In paragraph 276DE(b) after “limited leave to” insert “enter or”.

In paragraph 276DG(b) for “met the requirements of paragraphs 33B to 33G
of the Rules,” substitute “demonstrated sufficient knowledge of the English
language or about life in the Isle of Man in accordance with Appendix
KoLL,”.

After paragraph 276DH insert — “276D1 to 276BS1 Not used”.

After paragraph 276BS1(ii) insert a new paragraph starting at 276BT1 as
below:

“Parent of a Tier 4 (child) student

Requirements for leave to enter or remain as the parent of a Tier 4 (child)
student

276BT1 The requirements to be met by a person seeking leave to enter or
remain in the Isle of Man as the parent of a Tier 4 (child) student is that the
parent is over 18 years old and:

(i) is genuinely seeking leave to enter or remain for a period of up to 12
months to be the sole carer for their child who is under 12 years of age and
attending or seeking to attend an independent fee paying day school in the
Isle of Man, provided the child:

a) meets the requirements of paragraph 245ZZA if seeking leave to enter as a
Tier 4 (Child) Student, or

b) meets the requirements of paragraph 245Z7C if seeking leave to remain as
a Tier 4 (Child) Student;

(ii) will maintain and accommodate himself, the child and any other
dependants adequately out of resources available to him without recourse to
public funds or taking employment;

(iii) can provide satisfactory evidence of adequate and reliable funds for
maintaining a second home in the Isle of Man;

(iv) is not seeking to make the Isle of Man their main home;

(v) does not intend to take employment, to produce goods or provide services
within the Isle of Man including the selling of goods or services direct to
members of the public;

(vi) does not intend to study in the Isle of Man ;

(vii) the parent was not last admitted to the United Kingdom under the
Approved Destination Status Agreement with China;

(viii) if seeking leave to remain must not be in the Isle of Man in breach of
immigration laws except that any period of overstaying for a period of 28
days or less will be disregarded.



Leave to enter or remain as the parent of a Tier 4 (child) student

276BU1 A person seeking leave to enter or remain in the Isle of Man as the
parent of a Tier 4 (child) student may be admitted or allowed to remain for a
period not exceeding 12 months, subject to a condition prohibiting
employment, study and recourse to public funds, provided the Immigration
Officer or, in the case of an application for limited leave to remain, the
Lieutenant Governor is satisfied that each of the requirements of paragraph
276BT1 is met.”.

Refusal of leave to enter or remain as the parent of a Tier 4 (child) student

276BV1 Leave to enter or remain in the Isle of Man as the parent of a Tier 4
(child) student is to be refused if the Immigration Officer or, in the case of an
application for limited leave to remain, the Lieutenant Governor is not
satisfied that each of the requirements of paragraph 276BT1 is met.”.

141. In paragraph A277B after “Relevant Points Based System Migrant” insert ,
from a victim of domestic violence or from a bereaved spouse, civil partner,
unmarried partner or same sex partner”.

142. In paragraph A277B delete sub-paragraph (d).
143. After paragraph A277C insert:

“A277D. Where, pursuant to paragraphs A277A to A277C, a person who has
made an application for indefinite leave to remain to which Part 8 of these
rules continues to apply does not meet the requirements for indefinite leave to
remain but falls to be granted limited leave to remain under Part §,
paragraphs 276 ADE(1) to 276DH or Appendix FM, or outside the rules on
Article 8 grounds:

(a) The Lieutenant Governor will treat that application for indefinite leave to
remain as an application for limited leave to remain;

(b) Not used

(c) Not used”.
144. In paragraph A279 for “398-399D” substitute “A398-399D”.
145. After paragraph A280A insert:

“A280AA. Where a person aged 18 or over is granted limited leave to enter or
remain under Part 8 of these rules, or where a person granted such limited
leave to enter or remain will be aged 18 before that period of limited leave
expires, the leave will, in addition to any other conditions which may apply,
be granted subject to the condition in Part 15 of these rules.”.

146. In paragraph 289A (iii) delete final “and”.
147. In paragraph 298 (vii) delete “or 319X”.



148.

149.

150.

151.
152.

153.

154.

155.
156.
157.

158.

159.

In paragraph 319C(b)(iv) after “further leave to remain”, insert “, or has been
refused indefinite leave to remain solely because the applicant has not met the
requirements of paragraph 319E(g),”.

In Part 8, paragraph 319C(i)(ii)(2) delete “Recognised Body” and insert “UK
recognised body”.

In Part 8, paragraph 319H(h)(i)(ii)(2) delete “Recognised Body” and insert
“UK recognised body”.

After paragraph A320 insert —<“B320 Not used.”.
After paragraph 320(2) insert:
« (ZA)

Failure, if required to do so, by a person seeking entry to the Isle of Man to
provide a criminal record certificate from the relevant authority in any
country in which they have been resident for 12 months or more, in the past
10 years. Such evidence will not normally be required where:

i. The applicant is aged 17 years old or under at the date the application is
made; or

ii. It is not reasonably practicable for the applicant to obtain such evidence
from the relevant authorities.”.

In paragraph 320 (7B) (iv) delete “the removal decision” and substitute
“liability for removal”.

After paragraph 323(vi) delete:

“ »

And insert:

“; or

(vii) if, without a reasonable explanation, he fails to comply with a request
made by or on behalf of the Lieutenant Governor under paragraph 39D.”.
In paragraph 323A(a)(ii)(1), delete “Sponsor,” substitute “sponsor”.

In paragraph 323A(a)(ii)(2), delete “Sponsor” substitute “sponsor”.

In paragraph 323A(b)(i), delete “migrant’s Sponsor” substitute “migrant’s
sponsor”.

In paragraph 323A(b)(ii), delete “migrant’s Sponsor” substitute “migrant’s
sponsor”.

In paragraph 323A(b)(ii)(4), delete “but the Sponsor licence” substitute “but
the sponsor licence”.



160.

161.

162.

In paragraph 323A(b)(ii)(4), delete “allow the Sponsor” substitute “allow the
sponsor”.

In paragraph 323AA(a), delete “absent from work without pay for one
calendar month or more in total” and substitute “absent from work without
pay for 30 days or more in total”.

After Part 13 add:
“Part 14 Not Used

Part 15 Condition to hold an Academic Technology Approval Scheme
(ATAS) clearance certificate.

417. Where these Rules refer to leave to enter or remain in the Isle of Man
being granted to an individual, subject to the conditions set out in this Part 15,
such condition is as set out in (i) and (ii) below:

(i) no study which is:

(a) undergraduate or postgraduate study leading to a Doctorate or Masters
degree by research in one of the disciplines listed in paragraph 1 of Appendix
6 of these Rules, or

(b) undergraduate or postgraduate study leading to a taught Masters degree
or other postgraduate qualification in one of the disciplines listed in
paragraph 2 of Appendix 6 of these Rules, or

(c) a period of study or research in excess of 6 months in one of the disciplines
listed in paragraphs 1 or 2 of Appendix 6 of these Rules at an institution of
higher education where this forms part of an overseas postgraduate
qualification,

unless the migrant has obtained a valid Academic Technology Approval
Scheme clearance certificate from the Counter-Proliferation Department of the
Foreign and Commonwealth Office which was issued to the migrant prior to
the commencement of such study and that specifically relates to the course or
area of research the migrant wishes to undertake and to the institution at
which the applicant wishes to undertake it, and the migrant has provided a
print-out of the certificate to the institution, and

(i) if the migrant is undertaking a course or a period of research of a type
specified in (i) above and his course (or research) completion date is
postponed or delayed for a period of more than three calendar months or
there are any changes to the course contents (or the research proposal), the
migrant must apply for a new Academic Technology Approval Scheme
clearance certificate within 28 calendar days, and must provide a print-out of
the new certificate to the institution promptly after this is made available by
the Counter-Proliferation Department of the Foreign and Commonwealth
Office.”.



163.
164.

165.

Delete Appendix 1.

In Appendix 6 delete “ for the purposes of paragraphs 2452V and 245ZX of
these Rules.”.

Delete Appendix 7 and substitute —

“Appendix 7 — Statement of Written Terms and Conditions of employment

required in paragraph 159A (v), 159D (iv) and 159EA (iii)
Overseas Domestic Worker
Employment contract

Two copies of this form must be completed and signed by the employer
and the overseas domestic worker and submitted with the entry clearance
application or with the leave to remain application as required by

paragraphs 159A(v), 159D(iv), 159EA (iii), 245Z0(f)(ii), and 245ZQ]I(ii) of the

Immigration Rules.

1. Name & address of Employee

[insert details]

2. Name & address of Employer

[insert details]

3. Commencement of Employment & Termination

1. [If for an indefinite term]

[The Employee’s employment with the Employer commence[s OR d]
on [insert date], and will continue unless or until terminated in
accordance with the provisions of this agreement.]

[If for a fixed term]

[The Employee’s employment with the Employer shall [commence OR

be deemed to have commenced] on [insert date] and shall continue,

subject to the remaining terms of this agreement, until it terminates on

[insert date] without the need for notice unless previously terminated
by either party giving the other not less than [insert number*]
weeks/months’ notice in writing.]




* Note: the notice to be given by the Employer must not be less than
the statutory minimum period of notice to be given by employers,
which is as follows:

- during the first two years’ continuous employment, one week’s
notice; and

- after that, one additional week for each year of service, up to a
maximum of twelve weeks’ notice

2. No employment with a previous employer counts as part of a
period of continuous employment. OR The Employee’s employment
with [insert name of previous employer] forms part of a continuous period
of employment which began on [insert date].

4. Job Title

The Employee is employed as [insert job title] and his/her duties are set out
below:

[insert Employee’s duties]

5. Employee’s Place of Work

The Employee’s place of work is [insert location].

[If this is where the Employer resides, then the following information should
be provided]:

- Total number of rooms;
- Total number of bedrooms;

- The names and ages of all household members and domestic staff
(adults and minors) residing in the house.

[If the Employee’s place of work is different to the Employer’s residence, the
Employer is to provide an explanation, including details of where the
Employee will be working and who lives at that address]

6. Employee’s Hours of Work

1. The Employee’s normal hours of work are [insert number] hours per
week, to be worked during the hours of [insert time] to [insert time] on
[insert days] with a daily [paid OR unpaid] lunch break of [insert amount].

2. [The Employee is not required to work overtime]

OR

[The Employee is required to be available to work overtime, whenever




needed by the Employer at weekends, on public holidays or at other times
outside his/her normal hours of work.]

OR

[The Employee may, if he/she wishes, make himself/herself available to
work overtime outside his/her normal hours of work.]

OR

[The Employee may be required to work overtime if and when the
Employer deems it to be necessary.]

If the Employee works overtime, then complete the following paragraph
3. The Employee’s entitlement to pay for working overtime is as follows:

[insert details of overtime pay]

7. Pay

The Employee’s [salary is OR wages are] £[enter figure] per [hour OR week
OR month OR year] payable to the Employee at [weekly OR monthly]
intervals in arrears on[or about] the [insert day i.e. Friday OR last working day
OR insert date i.e. 25"] of each [week OR month]

The Employer agrees that the salary OR wages meet the requirements of the
National Minimum Wage Act 2001* (an Act of Tynwald) and any Regulations
made under it, and that they will continue to meet such requirements
throughout the period of employment.

The employer understands that they cannot claim exemption from meeting
the requirements above by claiming that the Employee lives as a member of
the family.

8. Holiday

1. The Employee will be entitled to [enter number —under the Annual Leave
Regulations 2007° this must be 4 weeks in each leave year] weeks’ paid holiday
in each holiday year, which runs from [enter date, e.g. 1 January] to [enter
date, e.g. 31 December], in addition to bank and public holidays. If the
Employee’s employment starts or finishes part way through the holiday
year, his/her holiday entitlement during that year shall be calculated on a
pro-rata basis.

2. The Emplo